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MSAB: Announces that Daniel Hilmgård has been 
appointed Chief Financial Officer effective August 
10, 2020. 

Daniel has an extensive experience of leading positions within finance, in private as well as 
publicly listed companies. He is currently CFO Chief Financial Officer at Natural Cycles, prior 
to that Daniel has held positions as CFO Chief Financial Officer and Head of Financial & 
Business Controlling in several international tech companies as Bambora, Seamless 
distribution (publ).  

“We are pleased to welcome Daniel to our management team as our CFO. Daniel´s has an 
excellent record as a CFO as well as business analytics, this will be a great value for MSAB, 
Daniels experience will benefit us as we see an increasing demand for MSAB offerings 
globally. I am very much looking forward working closely with Daniel to execute our growth 
strategy,” says Joel Bollö, CEO Chief Executive Officer MSAB. 

“I am very excited joining MSAB to support and develop the company and its business, it will 
be an honor being a part of making the world a safer place as well as working in a fast 
moving and growing business” says Daniel Hilmgård. 

  
 

MSAB in brief 

MSAB is a world leader in mobile forensics technology with the aim of extracting and 
analysing data from confiscated mobile devices, mainly from mobile phones. The company 
has offices and staff in Europe, North America, South America, China, Australia, Singapore, 
Japan and Russia, and together with a number of distributors, covers most of the world. 
MSAB’s proprietary products have become a de facto standard in the field and are used for 
securing evidence in more than 120 countries. These products are complemented by a wide 
range of professional services, including consultancy and training. Customers are primarily 
law enforcement agencies, such as police, military and customs. MSAB is listed on NASDAQ 
Stockholm under the ticker symbol: MSAB B. 
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