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Press release 

 

NOT FOR RELEASE, PUBLICATION OR DISTRIBUTION IN OR INTO THE UNITED STATES, 
AUSTRALIA, CANADA, JAPAN OR IN ANY OTHER JURISDICTION WHERE IT IS UNLAWFUL 

TO RELEASE, PUBLISH OR DISTRIBUTE THIS PRESS RELEASE 
 
Paris La Défense, June 2nd, 2025- Worldline [Euronext: WLN], a global leader in payment 
services, today announces that it is arranging a series of credit investor calls on Monday June 2nd, 
2025. Worldline is contemplating a 5-year fixed rate, senior unsecured Reg S fixed rate bond issuance 
denominated in euros under its EMTN programme (the “Bonds”), subject to market conditions. 
The Bonds are expected to be admitted to trading on the regulated market of the Luxembourg Stock 

Exchange.  

 

The net proceeds from this contemplated issuance of the Bonds would be applied by Worldline for 

general corporate purposes and the possible refinancing, in whole or in part, of its existing 

indebtedness including its €800m Convertible/Exchangeable Bonds due July 30, 2026 (the 

“OCEANEs”). 

 

The final terms of the contemplated Bonds, if issued, together with Worldline's base prospectus, will 

be available on Worldline’s website at the following address: 

https://investors.worldline.com/en/home/debt-and-rating. 

 

Worldline may in parallel consider buying back some of its outstanding OCEANEs in an opportunistic 
manner, subject to market conditions. 
 

  

https://investors.worldline.com/en/home/debt-and-rating
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IMPORTANT INFORMATION – DISCLAIMER 

This press release is not a prospectus for the purposes of Regulation (EU) 2017/1129 (as amended, 
the “Prospectus Regulation”). This press release does not constitute and shall not, in any 
circumstances, constitute a public offering nor an invitation to the public in connection with any offer 
within the meaning of the Prospectus Regulation or otherwise. The potential issue of the Bonds is not 
a public offering in any country or jurisdiction, including in France, to any person other than qualified 
investors (as defined in Article 2(e) of the Prospectus Regulation).  

The distribution of this press release may be restricted by law in certain jurisdictions. Persons into 
whose possession this press release comes should inform themselves about and observe any 
applicable legal and regulatory restrictions.  

The Bonds are intended to be offered outside the United States pursuant to Regulation S under the 
U.S. Securities Act of 1933, as amended (the “Securities Act”), subject to prevailing market and other 
conditions. The Bonds will not be registered under the Securities Act or the securities laws of any 
other jurisdiction and may not be offered or sold in the United States absent registration or unless 
pursuant to an applicable exemption from the registration requirements of the Securities Act and any 
other applicable securities laws. This press release does not constitute an offer or the solicitation of 
an offer relating to the Bonds, nor shall it constitute an offer, solicitation or sale in any jurisdiction in 
which such offer, solicitation or sale would be unlawful. 

The Bonds are not intended to be offered, sold or otherwise made available to and should not be 
offered, sold or otherwise made available to any retail investor in the European Economic Area (the 
“EEA”). For these purposes, a “retail investor” means a person who is one (or more) of: (i) a retail 
client as defined in point (11) of Article 4(1) of Directive 2014/65/EU (as amended, “MiFID II”); or (ii) a 
customer within the meaning of Directive (EU) 2016/97, as amended, where that customer would not 
qualify as a professional client as defined in point (10) of Article 4(1) of MiFID II; or (iii) a person who 
is not a qualified investor within the meaning of Article 2(e) of the Prospectus Regulation. 

The Bonds are not intended to be offered, sold or otherwise made available to and should not be 
offered, sold or otherwise made available to any retail investor in the United Kingdom (“UK”). For 
these purposes, a “retail investor” means a person who is one (or more) of the following: (i) a retail 
client, as defined in point (8) of Article 2 of Regulation (EU) No. 2017/565 as it forms part of UK 
domestic law by virtue of the European Union (Withdrawal) Act 2018 (the “EUWA”); (ii) a customer 
within the meaning of the provisions of the Financial Services and Markets Act 2000 (as amended, 
the “FSMA”) and any rules or regulations made thereunder to implement Directive (EU) 2016/97, 
where that customer would not qualify as a professional client, as defined in point (8) of Article 2(1) of 
Regulation (EU) No 600/2014 as it forms part of UK domestic law by virtue of the EUWA; or (iii) a 
person who is not a qualified investor as defined in Article 2 of Regulation (EU) 2017/1129 as it forms 
part of domestic law by virtue of the EUWA. 

The dissemination of this press release in any country where such dissemination could constitute a 
violation of applicable legislation is prohibited. 
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FORTHCOMING EVENTS 

• June 5, 2025: Annual General Meeting  

• July 30, 2025:  H1 2025 results  
 
INVESTOR RELATIONS 

Laurent Marie 

E laurent.marie@worldline.com 

Peter Farren 

E peter.farren@worldline.com 

COMMUNICATION 

Sandrine van der Ghinst 

E sandrine.vanderghinst@worldline.com 

Hélène Carlander 

E helene.carlander@worldline.com 

 
ABOUT WORLDLINE 

Worldline [Euronext: WLN] helps businesses of all shapes and sizes to accelerate their growth journey 
– quickly, simply, and securely. With advanced payment technology, local expertise, and solutions 
customised for hundreds of markets and industries, Worldline powers the growth of over one million 
businesses worldwide. Worldline generated a 4.6 billion euros revenue in 2024. worldline.com 

Worldline’s corporate purpose (“raison d’être”) is to design and operate leading digital payment and 
transactional solutions that enable sustainable economic growth and reinforce trust and security in 
our societies. Worldline makes them environmentally friendly, widely accessible, and supports social 
transformation. 

FOLLOW US 

            

 

DISCLAIMER 

This press release may not be released, published or distributed, directly or indirectly, in or into the United States of 

America, Australia, Canada or Japan. The distribution of this press release may be restricted by law in certain 

jurisdictions and persons into whose possession any document or other information referred to herein comes, should 

inform themselves about and observe any such restriction. Any failure to comply with these restrictions may constitute 

a violation of the securities laws of any such jurisdiction. 
 

 

mailto:laurent.marie@worldline.com
mailto:peter.farren@worldline.com
mailto:sandrine.vanderghinst@worldline.com
mailto:helene.carlander@worldline.com
https://fra01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Furldefense.com%2Fv3%2F__https%3A%2Ffra01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%3Furl%3Dhttp*3A*2F*2Fwww.worldline.com*2F%26data%3D04*7C01*7Chelene.carlander*40worldline.com*7C6ecb37b313454d07118608d9f6e348e3*7Cfda9decfe89243ac9d9f1a493f9f98d0*7C0*7C0*7C637812278312253369*7CUnknown*7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0*3D*7C3000%26sdata%3DrZYoJ*2BZdymjbYrGTTgxC*2BB9PVKdCYsdesY2HWOs9pck*3D%26reserved%3D0__%3BJSUlJSUlJSUlJSUlJSUlJSUlJQ!!KtIQeTNdMUQ6!oJJlUwVm60EVaeU41pwLn71yzFEGbuz6DvEyMdp6Boi4yvYBPeNSse6qzZlyGnhEj_6KMw%24&data=04%7C01%7Cannemieke.lambregts%40worldline.com%7Ce88e427352e14ab9d80b08d9fa8ebd77%7Cfda9decfe89243ac9d9f1a493f9f98d0%7C0%7C0%7C637816313378683151%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000&sdata=qBTrNM3w%2B4ZE%2FXDmf9vUh1B4O6Nbm3EhMHZWNEip5Z8%3D&reserved=0
https://worldline.com/blog
https://worldline.com/twitter
https://worldline.com/linkedin
https://worldline.com/facebook
https://worldline.com/youtube
https://worldline.com/instagram

